
Recertification Notice of Intent (NOI)
NPDES General Permit for Construction and Discharge of Uncontaminated Stormwater from a Sanitary Landfill

Sediment Pond ARG 160000

You must complete, certify, and sign this Recertification Notice of Intent (NOI) form and return it to the Department in order to
continue permit coverage under the General Permit ARG160000. You must submit this form no later than Februarv 28. 2015.
Please keep a copy ofthis form for your records once completed and signed.

Pellllit Tracking Number:ARG160017

Permittec Name:City of Fort Smith

If any changes need to be made to the information shown below, please update the new information in the corrections section below
and/or attach documentation.

1.

計31昇絆[‖11,tached an updated disclosure
ls the invoice address the same as the mailing
address above?

Yes or No

YesorNo     lλ 3還ξl‰

AFIN:66¨ 00226

2.

Outfall Currentlv Listed in ADEO's Database*

Outfan Number Latitude Longitude
001 35° 18` 00" 94° 21' 40。29"

* Ifachangetotheaboveoutfallisneeded,pleasebesuretoprovidetheoutfallnumber,coordinates,andanexplanationoftherequiredchanges

Additional Comments:

"l certifo under penalty of law that this document and all attachments were prepared under my direction or supervision in accordance

with a system designed to assure that qualified personnel properly gather and evaluate the information submitted. Based on my inquiry
of the person or persons who manage the system, or those persons directly responsible for gathering the information, the information
submitted is, to the best of my knowledge and belief, true, accurate, and complete. I am aware that there are significant penalties for
submitting false information, including the possibility of fine and imprisonment for knowing violations."

I certifu that I have read and will comply with all the requirements of the NPDES General Permit ARGl60000 for Construction and

Discharge of Uncontaminated Stormwater from a Sanitary Landfill Sediment Pond.

Responsible Offi cial Name:
Responsible Official Title:

Responsible OIfi cial Signatu re:
Date:

Return the NOI form to the address below or send it electronically to: water.nermit.aoolication@adeq.state.ar.us
Water Division, General Permits Section
Arkansas Department of Environmental Quality
5301 Northshore Drive
North Little Rock, AR 72118-5317

Current lnformation in ADEQ's Database Corrections, If Needed
Facility Physical Address: City ofFort Smith Sanitation Dept

5900 Commerce Road

Fort Smith,AR 72916

Facility Mailine Address: 5900 Commerce Road
Fort Smith,AR 72916

Responsible Official: T RariAI NhLhf^i
Responsible Offi cial Email : hnlrnftar,ti (,i E^ r +.s,h',+{^aQ .qov
Cognizant Official: Charlie Sanders dohn_rを Lr n´ s
Cosnizant Offi cial Email : tいnrnρヽFヽ r^r+、

“
iキh nR osv

Contact Person: Charlie Sanders I]6h n&ゝ rneゝ
Phone Number: 479‐ 784-2461



From: Temple, Jessica
To: Blevins, Terri
Subject: FW: ARG160017 invoice address
Date: Monday, March 02, 2015 12:47:20 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Can you please save this email and attach it to the ARG160017 file in my folder?
 

From: Vanourny, Stacy [mailto:sritchie@FortSmithAR.gov] 
Sent: Monday, March 02, 2015 12:29 PM
To: Temple, Jessica
Cc: Barnes, John
Subject: RE: ARG160017 invoice address
 
Ms. Temple,
 
The invoice address is the same as the mailing address of 5900 Commerce Road, Fort Smith, AR
72916.  Please let us know if you require further information.
 
Kind regards,
 

Stacy Vanourny
Administrative Coordinator
 
City of Fort Smith | Department of Sanitation
5900 Commerce Road | Fort Smith, Arkansas 72916
P: 479.784.1070 | F: 479.788.4140 | M: 479.831.6015
svanourny@FortSmithAR.gov | FortSmithSanitation.com
 
 

 

P Please don't print this  e-mail unless you really need to do so.

 
 
 

From: Barnes, John 
Sent: Monday, March 02, 2015 12:26 PM
To: Vanourny, Stacy
Subject: Fwd: ARG160017 invoice address
 
Please see below

mailto:/O=ARKANSAS DEPT. OF ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY/OU=ADEQ1/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=TEMPLEJ
mailto:blevins@adeq.state.ar.us
mailto:svanourny@FortSmithAR.gov
http://www.fortsmithsanitation.com/

For
Departme

Sanitation





John Barnes
Landfill Manager
City of Fort Smith Sanitation

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Temple, Jessica" <TEMPLEJ@adeq.state.ar.us>
Date: March 2, 2015 at 12:19:43 PM CST
To: "'jbarnes@fortsmithar.gov'" <jbarnes@fortsmithar.gov>
Cc: "'bnkokheli@fortsmithar.gov'" <bnkokheli@fortsmithar.gov>
Subject: ARG160017 invoice address

Mr. Barnes,
 
The Department is in receipt of the Recertification NOI for ARG160017, City of Fort
Smith.  The question regarding the invoice address was not completed.  Can you please
let me know if the invoice address is the same as the mailing address that we have on
file, which is 5900 Commerce Road, Fort Smith, AR 72916, or if we need to send the
invoices to another address?
 
Thanks,
Jessica Temple
Engineer
ADEQ-Water Division
501-682-0621
 
 

mailto:TEMPLEJ@adeq.state.ar.us
mailto:jbarnes@fortsmithar.gov
mailto:jbarnes@fortsmithar.gov
mailto:bnkokheli@fortsmithar.gov
mailto:bnkokheli@fortsmithar.gov


From: Temple, Jessica
To: Blevins, Terri; Peltier, Hannah
Subject: FW: ARG160017 invoice address
Date: Tuesday, March 03, 2015 4:03:16 PM

Can you please save this email with the ARG160017 in the Jessica NOI folder?
 

From: Barnes, John [mailto:jbarnes@FortSmithAR.gov] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 03, 2015 3:42 PM
To: Temple, Jessica
Subject: Re: ARG160017 invoice address
 
N 35 degrees 18.251
W 094 degrees 21.665
448 feet elevation
 

John Barnes
Landfill Manager
City of Fort Smith Sanitation

On Mar 2, 2015, at 12:32 PM, Temple, Jessica <TEMPLEJ@adeq.state.ar.us> wrote:

Could you please send me the coordinates? 
 
Thanks,
Jessica Temple
Engineer
ADEQ-Water Division
501-682-0621
 
 
 

From: Barnes, John [mailto:jbarnes@FortSmithAR.gov] 
Sent: Monday, March 02, 2015 12:28 PM
To: Temple, Jessica
Cc: Nkokheli,T. Baridi; Brad N. Fureigh
Subject: Re: ARG160017 invoice address
 
That is not correct. The outfall is on the back of the sediment pond. 

John Barnes
Landfill Manager
City of Fort Smith Sanitation

On Mar 2, 2015, at 12:25 PM, Temple, Jessica <TEMPLEJ@adeq.state.ar.us> wrote:

Mr. Barnes,

mailto:/O=ARKANSAS DEPT. OF ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY/OU=ADEQ1/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=TEMPLEJ
mailto:blevins@adeq.state.ar.us
mailto:peltier@adeq.state.ar.us
mailto:TEMPLEJ@adeq.state.ar.us
mailto:jbarnes@FortSmithAR.gov
mailto:TEMPLEJ@adeq.state.ar.us


 
I apologize for not including this with my last email, but I do have one
more question.  Can you please confirm the location of the outfall at this
facility?  The coordinates which were on the Recertification NOI are
shown below.  The outfall is usually at the discharge point of the
sedimentation pond and should be where you take your samples.  From
the Google Earth image, this does not look correct, so please let me know.
 
<image001.jpg>
 
 
Thanks,
Jessica Temple
Engineer
ADEQ-Water Division
501-682-0621
 
 
 

From: Temple, Jessica 
Sent: Monday, March 02, 2015 12:20 PM
To: 'jbarnes@fortsmithar.gov'
Cc: 'bnkokheli@fortsmithar.gov'
Subject: ARG160017 invoice address
 
Mr. Barnes,
 
The Department is in receipt of the Recertification NOI for ARG160017,
City of Fort Smith.  The question regarding the invoice address was not
completed.  Can you please let me know if the invoice address is the same
as the mailing address that we have on file, which is 5900 Commerce
Road, Fort Smith, AR 72916, or if we need to send the invoices to another
address?
 
Thanks,
Jessica Temple
Engineer
ADEQ-Water Division
501-682-0621
 
 

mailto:jbarnes@fortsmithar.gov
mailto:bnkokheli@fortsmithar.gov

